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Introduction:
Untreated wastewater generated from various
sources, particularly from households, causes
environmental problems, such as diseases and
the destruction of water resources and
biodiversity. In the Philippines, wastewater
treatment is quite challenging to implement due
to financial and technological constraints. One
approach to address these constraints is the use
of nature-based solutions for wastewater
treatment, particularly the Constructed Wetlands
(CW). CW are engineered systems mimicking the
process of natural wetlands: use of soil and plants
to treat the wastewater. In the CW, the plants are
usually grass due to their resistance to harsh
conditions of wastewater, while the soil media or
substrates used are gravel and sand for effective
filtration and adsorption of the pollutants. Other
pollutants and nutrients can be taken up by the
plants for further treatment of the wastewater,
while its deep and massive root systems provide
the environment for microorganisms culture that
can also be used for the removal of other organic
matter in the wastewater. Aside from this, CW
provides ecological benefits such as promotion of
biodiversity conservation, aesthetic for tourism
and even as a source of livelihood. CWs are
relatively low-cost and require less technical
support compared with conventional wastewater
treatment systems. However, they are not widely
adopted in the Philippines due to the large area
requirement and limited large-scale sites in the
country to showcase its effectiveness. Currently,
there is no framework for CW to guide its
implementation in the country which could
improve its replicability.
This brochure endeavors to bridge that gap by
presenting a framework guide for CW
implementation in the Philippines.
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Constructed Wetlands (CW) Guide Framework

Step 1: Suitability mapping for CW in terms of
landuse, slope, soil type, distance to water
bodies, protected areas, built-up areas, and
population centres, and hazards maps

Steps 2-4, 7, 10: Design, construction, and
operation and maintenance of CW can be
patterned from the Bayawan City (complete
manual can be found in their website)

Steps  5-6: Survey instruments can be
provided by SCPW for the social acceptability
and economic analysis of CW

Step 11: Platform for research advancements
database in CW will still need to be established
but can be consulted with various universities
doing similar research studies, such as the
Univeristy of the Philippines.

CW operation, maintenance, and troubleshooting at
Bayawan City for domestic wastewater treatment

The framework can be used if new construction (Steps 1-11) or existing CW (Steps 8-11). Every step of the
framework requires consultative meetings with stakeholders to promote community engagement and

ownership of the CW system, thus ensuring sustainability.

Site Development and Conceptual Design of CW
at Bayawan City

Guide table for CW performance monitoring 
(Steps 8-11)


